BID NO.: 24-28

CITY OF FARMERS BRANCH, BID TABULATION

OPENING DATE: 5/29/24

anous Trailers

ITEM(S) OR PROJECT DESCRIPTION:

the a state of the contract of		BIDDERS		
Happy Trailers				
CHECK IF NO BID	CHECK IF NO BID	CHECK IF NO BID	CHECK IF NO BID	CHECK IF NO BID
SFT. Utility Sell, 477.08				
\$15,591.00				
#15,591.00 16 Ft. Flot led \$ 8,849.00				
TOTAL \$	TOTAL \$	TOTAL \$	TOTAL \$	TOTAL \$
ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE
	·			
DELIVERY:	DELIVERY:	DELIVERY:	DELIVERY:	DELIVERY:
DISCOUNT:	DISCOUNT:	DISCOUNT:	DISCOUNT:	DISCOUNT:
NET TERMS:	NET TERMS:	NET TERMS:	NET TERMS:	NET TERMS:



HAPPY TRAILER SALES

Company Info: 2975 S CHURCH ST PARIS, TX 75462, USA Sales Info: Jordan Loewen Phone: (903) 732-5221 Customer Info: City of Farmers Branch Phone: 469-585-0188 Email: kenneth.lemoine@farmersbranchtx.gov

6" Channel Equipment

Quote #226677

- 16 feet
- BP 2 5/16" Adjustable
- (2) 7,000# w/14 Ply LR-G Tires Electric / Spring
- · 2' Dovetail w/ Split Heavy Duty Gate
- Primer + Black Powder Coat

Options:

3/16" DP Steel Floor & 4 Flushmount D-Rings & 12"oc



* actual product may vary from image shown

Notes:

Delivery: \$200[92BS] (2) 7,000# w/14 Ply LR-G Tires Electric / Spring\$330.00[K] 2' Dovetail w/ Split Heavy Duty Gate\$479.00[K] Primer +Black Powder Coat[-SF04] 3/16" DP Steel Floor & 4 Flushmount D-Rings & 12"oc\$968.43

Standard Features

- 14,000 lb. G.V.W.R.
- 7,000 lb. x 2 G.A.W.R.
- Demco EZ Latch Adj. 2 5/16" Ball Coupler
- Safety Chains
- 1 Drop Leg Jack (10,000 lb.)
- 2 E- Z lube Brake Axles (7,000 lb.)
- 6 Leaf Slipper Spring Suspension
- 4 16" Black Mod Wheels
- 4 235/80R16 Radial Tires (3,520 lb)
- Stake Pockets

- Electric Breakaway Kit w/ Charger
- 9" x 72" Treadplate Removable Steel Fenders
- 5' Channel Rear Slide-in Ramps
- Dual Bulldog Rear Support Jacks
- 6" Channel Frame & Tongue
- 3" Channel Crossmembers 16" on Center
- 2" Treated Pine Lumber Deck
- 83" Wide Deck
- DOT Approved Flushmount Lifetime LED Lights
- All-Weather Wiring Harness (7-way RV)

- Sand Blasted, Acid Washed, Powder Coated
- · Tool Tray In Tongue
- GN Option Equipped with 2 Jacks
- GN Equipped w/Lockable Front Toolbox
- 5 year Axle Warranty
- 6 D-Rings (Welded)
- Spare Tire Mount

Trailer Price: \$8,499.00

Taxes: \$0.00

Fees: \$150.00

Registration: \$0.00

Other: \$200.00

Total Price: \$8,849.00





Date: 02/29/2024

Customer Information

Name: City of Farmers Branch

Email: kenneth.lemoine@farmersbranchtx.gov

Phone: (469) 585-0188

Dealership Information

Salesperson: Jordan Loewen

Email: jordan.loewen@happytrailers.com

Phone: (903) 732-5221

Address: 2975 S Church St Paris, TX 75460

Trailer Configu	Amount			
E816	Enclosed Cargo 8'x16'		\$11,340.00	
F02	2"X6" Tubing Frame		\$878.00	
Α	2 5/16 Adjustable Couple Bumper Pull		\$0.00	
72ET	Axle, 7K Torsion x 2		\$0.00	
Χ	Spring Assist Ramp Rear Gate		\$684.00	
W	White Powder Paint		\$0.00	
J07	Jack, 7K Dropleg		\$0.00	
F89	Floor, Expanded Metal		\$902.00	
T57	7' Tall (per running foot)		\$688.00	
N71	Flat Nose on Front		\$0.00	
T26	235/80R16 LRE Radial 10ply Tires		\$0.00	
R17	2 Weed Eater Racks (Holds 3 Weed Eaters Each)	\$258.00	
G01	1 ft Longer Tongue		\$228.00	
	12" On Center Cross Members		\$263.00	
		TRAILER	\$15,241.00	
		Documentation Fee	\$150.00	
		Delivery Fee	\$200.00	
		(\$400 for pulling doubles / 2 TOTAL:		
Customer Signature: \$15,591				





Date: 02/28/2024

Customer Information

Name: City of Farmers Branch

Email: kenneth.lemoine@farmersbranchtx.gov

Customer Signature: _____

Phone: (469) 585-0188

Dealership Information

Salesperson: Jordan Loewen

Email: jordan.loewen@happytrailers.com

Phone: (903) 732-5221

1 none. (405) 50	35 0100	Address: 2975 S Church	St Paris, TX 75462
Trailer Config	uration		Amount
CE618B	83" x 18' 6" Channel Equipment 14k - 2 5/16" 21kAdjustable Coupler - 6" Channel Frame - 10k Drop Leg Jack - Diamond Plate Fenders - LED Lights		\$6,000.00
27ES	[2] 7K EZ Lube Straight Axles w/ Electric Brakes & Spring Suspension		\$0.00
14PLY	14 Ply Tire Upgrade (per tire) (add +20 lbs)		\$407.00
B10	FRONT TOOLBOX		\$226.00
33TT	20" Tall 3 x 3 Tubing Top Rail with solid Metal sides		\$1,050.00
4FG	2' Dovetail w/ 4' Spring Assist Gate ***Extra Supports***		\$282.00
Steel Floor	11 ga Steel Floor and 12" OC Cross-members		\$2,034.00
D	Weld-on D-rings Pair (2)		\$622.00
B (Color)	Raven Black Paint w/ Primer		\$0.00
	*** Need top rail to remain level even with the dov	etail see Jake***	
Services	***Custom Expanded metal boxed behind Fender both sides see Jake***		\$452.08
	(\$400 for puiling doubles + \$108 for receives hit	TRAILER Documentation Fee Delivery Fee tch on every other trailer, \$25	\$11,073.08 \$150.00 \$254.00 4 per trailer)
Customor Sia	noture.	TOTAL:	\$11,477.08